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Definition
Association rules (Agrawal, Imieliński, & Swami, )
can be extracted from data sets where each example
consists of a set of items. An association rule has the
form X → Y , where X and Y are 7itemsets, and the
interpretation is that if set X occurs in an example, then
set Y is also likely to occur in the example.

Each association rule is usually associated with two
statistics measured from the given data set. �e fre-
quency or support of a rule X → Y , denoted fr(X → Y),
is the number (or alternatively the relative frequency)
of examples in which X ∪ Y occurs. Its con�dence, in
turn, is the observed conditional probability P(Y ∣ X) =
fr(X ∪ Y)/fr(X).

�e7Apriori algorithm (Agrawal,Mannila, Srikant,
Toivonen & Verkamo, ) �nds all association rules,
between any sets X and Y , which exceed user-speci�ed

support and con�dence thresholds. In association rule
mining, unlike in most other learning tasks, the result
thus is a set of rules concerning di�erent subsets of the
feature space.

Association rules were originally motivated by
supermarket 7basket analysis, but as a domain inde-
pendent technique they have found applications in
numerous �elds. Association rule mining is part of the
larger �eld of 7frequent itemset or 7frequent pattern
mining.
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